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Edward Maria Wingfield, the first governor of Jamestown, is a figure
shrouded in mystery and intrigue. His life and legacy have been the subject
of much debate and speculation, but one thing is for sure: he played a
pivotal role in the early history of America.

Wingfield was born in England in 1550. He was a member of a prominent
Catholic family, and he received a classical education. In 1589, he sailed to
America with Sir Walter Raleigh's expedition. He was one of the first
English settlers in the New World, and he helped to establish the colony of
Roanoke Island.
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In 1607, Wingfield was appointed governor of Jamestown, the first
permanent English settlement in America. He was a controversial figure,
and he was often at odds with the other settlers. He was accused of being
arrogant and intolerant, and he was eventually removed from office.

Despite his flaws, Wingfield was a man of vision. He was a strong believer
in the potential of the New World, and he worked tirelessly to promote its
development. He was also a skilled writer and cartographer, and he left
behind a valuable record of his experiences in Jamestown.

Wingfield's legacy is a complex one. He was a flawed and enigmatic figure,
but he also made a significant contribution to the early history of America.
His story is a reminder of the challenges and opportunities that faced the
early settlers, and it is a testament to the indomitable spirit of the American
people.

Edward Maria Wingfield And His Times: Jamestown 400th
Anniversary Edition

To commemorate the 400th anniversary of the founding of Jamestown,
historian David A. Price has written a new biography of Edward Maria
Wingfield. This book, titled 'Edward Maria Wingfield And His Times:
Jamestown 400th Anniversary Edition', is the most comprehensive and up-
to-date account of Wingfield's life and career.

Price's book is based on extensive research, and it draws on a wide range
of sources, including Wingfield's own writings, the records of the Virginia
Company, and the accounts of other early settlers. Price provides a
balanced and nuanced portrait of Wingfield, and he sheds new light on his
motivations and actions.



'Edward Maria Wingfield And His Times: Jamestown 400th Anniversary
Edition' is an essential read for anyone interested in the early history of
America. It is a fascinating and informative account of the life and career of
Edward Maria Wingfield, one of the most important figures in American
history.

Free Download Your Copy Today!

To Free Download your copy of 'Edward Maria Wingfield And His Times:
Jamestown 400th Anniversary Edition', please visit the following website:

https:/

You can also Free Download the book from your local bookstore.
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Step into the captivating world of Charles the Bold, Duke of Burgundy, as
renowned historian Robert Schlesinger presents a meticulously
illustrated masterpiece that breathes...
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